
BID SUMMARY
FACILITIES MANAGEMENT

RFP #6565 SEPTEMBER 24, 2010
ROBERT G. DEVAULT

HURON VALLEY PARK AVENUE LUMASMART
ELECTRIC LIGHTING, INC TECHNOLOGY

INTERNATIONAL
LOCATION INC

705 N. ZEEB ROAD (LED) 35,500.00$                      38,083.79$                      20,430.00$                      

4125 WASHTENAW AVE (LED) 38,400.00$                      38,864.98$                      16,477.00$                      

101 E HURON PARKING (LED) 40,400.00$                      40,465.92$                      26,545.00$                      

TOTALS FOR LED RETROFIT 114,300.00$                    117,414.69$                    63,452.00$                      

101 E. HURON (T-8) 30,500.00$                      NO BID 19,500.00$                      

220 N. MAIN STREET (T-8) 5,900.00$                        NO BID 10,575.00$                      

415 W. MICHIGAN AVE (T-8) 5,980.00$                        NO BID 1,975.00$                        

555 TOWNER STREET (t-8) 12,600.00$                      NO BID 5,925.00$                        

TOTALS FOR T-8 RETROFIT 54,980.00$                      37,975.00$                      

LED Retrofit awarded to Huron Valley
Electric as most responsive and 
responsible bidder.  Lumasmart was
disqualified as fixtures were not listed
or approved by "authority having
jurisdiction"

T-8 Retrofit not awarded due to 
insufficient available budget.


