
BID SUMMARY
Facilities Management

RFP # 6548  7/30/2010
ROBERT G. DEVAULT

DRV Cusack's D.C. Byers RAM
Contractors Masonry Company/ Construction

LLC Restoration, Inc Detroit Services of
Michigan, Inc

BASE PROPOSAL SUM TOTAL $123,000.00 $132,724.00 $95,781.00 $77,295.00

ALTERNATE $11,700.00 $4,500.00 $6,750.00 $7,531.00

Brick repointing, per square foot $28.00/$25.50 $6.75/$6.75 $19.00/$16.00 $12.60/$12.60

Deep brick repointing, per square foot $38.00/$34.20 $8.75/$8.75 $38.00/$35.00 $13.00/$13.00

Remove and reset bricks, per square foot $146.00/$133.00 $85.00/$85.00 $86.00/$79.00 $63.50/$63.50

Stone repointing, per lIneal foot $4.60/$4.20 $6.75/$6.75 $5.00/$5.00 $3.81/$3.81

Replace sealant, per lineal foot $3.75/$3.35 $6.75/$6.75 $5.00/$5.00 $4.10/$4.10

Replace existing lead cap, per each $85.00/$77.00 $35.00/$35.00 $100.00/$100.00 $86.50/$86.50

Removal of cementitious patches or parging; $140.50/$128.00 $85.00/$85.00 $86.00/$79.00 $96.00/$96.00
replacement with brick & mortar per square foot

Removal of high-strength mortar; $40.00/$36.00 $88.00/$88.00 $25.00/$22.00 $13.00/$13.00
repointing, per square foot

Installation of helifix anchors, per each $25.00/ n/a $22.00/$22.00 $15.00/$15.00 $25.00/$25.00



BID SUMMARY
Facilities Management

RFP # 6548  7/30/2010
ROBERT G. DEVAULT

Akins Grunwell- Mihm J.C. Beal
Construction Cashero Enterprises Construction

Inc Company Inc Inc

BASE PROPOSAL SUM TOTAL $64,710.00 $119,000.00 $233,885.00 NO BID

ALTERNATE $7,250.00 $7,000.00 $19,440.00 NO BID

Brick repointing, per square foot $18.00/$15.00 $10.00/$10.00 $45.00/$45.00 NO BID

Deep brick repointing, per square foot $25.00/$20.00 $12.00/$12.00 $55.00/$55.00 NO BID

Remove and reset bricks, per square foot $70.00/$65.00 $100.00/$100.00 $75.00/$75.00 NO BID

Stone repointing, per lIneal foot $4.50/$4.25 $7.00/$7.00 $50.00/$50.00 NO BID

Replace sealant, per lineal foot $3.50/$3.25 $7.00/$7.00 $4.00/$4.00 NO BID

Replace existing lead cap, per each $70.00/$65.00 $30.00/$30.00 $27.50/$27.50 NO BID

Removal of cementitious patches or parging; $70.00/$65.00 $100.00/$100.00 $100.00/$100.00 NO BID
replacement with brick & mortar per square foot

Removal of high-strength mortar; $18.00/$15.00 $11.00/$11.00 $65.00/$65.00 NO BID
repointing, per square foot

Installation of helifix anchors, per each $6.00/$6.00 $20.00/$20.00 $125.00/$125.00 NO BID

Awarded to Akins Construction Inc


