
BID SUMMARY
Parks Recreation for 
Pierce Lake Golf Course

RFP # 6519
Fertilizer Pesticides

 2/25/2010

CRYSTAL WAKE

Agruim Turfgrass Helena Harrells John Great Tri
Advanced Inc Chemical LLC Deere Lakes Turf

Technologies Company  Landscapes Turf, LLC

No. 1 No Bid 3,780.00$    No Bid No Bid
Alt. 1,960.00$    2,047.36$    2,660.00$  

No. 2 No Bid 405.00$       No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alt. 189.52$       

No. 3 No Bid 780.00$       No Bid
Alt. 515.40$       630.00$       980.88$       948.00$     

No. 4  No Bid 3,282.30$    No Bid 2,970.00$    No Bid
Alt. 1,458.00$    2,160.00$  

No. 5 No Bid No Bid 3,531.60$    No Bid 2,574.00$  
Alt. 3,090.00$    2,920.80$    

No. 6 938.80$       900.00$       
Alt. 618.00$             625.00$       996.00$       4,370.00$  1,034.00$  

No. 7 No Bid 5,596.80$    No Bid 5,183.40$  
Alt. 6,398.16$          8,352.00$    5,471.72$    

No. 8 No Bid 3,241.20$    No Bid 2,066.40$    No Bid No Bid 3,066.00$  

No. 9 6,412.50$    6,300.00$    No Bid
Alt. 7,987.50$          5,130.00$    4,713.75$    5,249.25$    4,860.00$  
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Agruim Turfgrass Helena Harrells John Great Tri
Advanced Inc Chemical LLC Deere Lakes Turf

Technologies Company  Landscapes Turf, LLC

No. 10 A No Bid 1,362.50$    No Bid 1,237.50$    1,237.50$    No Bid 1,237.50$  
No. 10 B No Bid 513.00$       No Bid 513.00$       513.00$       No Bid 513.00$     

No. 11 2,277.00$          2,277.00$    2,277.00$    2,277.00$    2,277.00$    No Bid 2,277.00$  
Alt.
 
No. 12 3,410.00$          3,410.00$    3,410.00$    3,410.00$    
Alt. 2,596.00$    2,415.60$    2,640.00$    2,948.00$    2,821.50$  2,527.80$  

No. 13 637.50$             850.00$       3,625.00$    750.00$       1,000.00$    No Bid
Alt. 725.00$     

No. 14 A 11,205.00$        5,040.00$    11,205.00$  11,205.00$  11,205.00$  5,643.00$  4,317.75$  
No. 14 B No Bid 4,636.00$    4,680.00$    4,320.00$    No Bid No Bid No Bid

No. 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alt. 2,790.00$    2,366.10$    

No. 16 1,705.20$          1,705.20$    1,705.20$    1,705.20$    1,705.20$    No Bid 1,705.20$  

No. 17 1,840.00$          920.00$       1,748.00$    1,840.00$    1,840.00$    2,071.00$  
Alt. 1,600.00$    1,359.60$  

No. 18 573.75$             641.00$       623.64$       630.00$       675.00$       No Bid
Alt. 598.50$       930.00$     
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CRYSTAL WAKE

Agruim Turfgrass Helena Harrells John Great Tri
Advanced Inc Chemical LLC Deere Lakes Turf

Technologies Company  Landscapes Turf, LLC

No. 19 954.10$             1,043.00$    975.45$       1,016.82$    No Bid
Alt. 799.68$       1,085.00$  

No. 20 No Bid 3,510.00$    No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alt. 7,800.00$    

No. 21 1,215.00$          1,215.00$    1,215.00$    1,215.00$    1,215.00$    No Bid
Alt. 797.87$     

No. 22 864.92$             1,017.55$    2,035.90$    1,555.00$    1,073.68$    No Bid
Alt. 996.00$       510.00$     

No. 23 454.05$             439.80$       345.00$       No Bid
Alt. 351.00$       390.00$       527.04$       330.00$     

No. 24 144.00$             645.00$       144.02$       No Bid 166.16$       No Bid 158.00$     

No. 25 469.12$             480.00$       464.08$       531.40$       516.68$       No Bid 580.00$     

No. 26 943.50$             898.44$       319.50$       1,546.44$    541.50$     
Alt. 327.95$       300.00$       367.50$     

No. 27 No Bid No Bid 600.00$       920.00$       1,185.60$    No Bid
Alt. 996.00$     
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No. 28 No Bid 121.00$       123.72$       No Bid 99.00$       
Alt. 106.44$       72.00$         

No. 29 No Bid 166.00$       No Bid 322.80$       No Bid 246.00$     
Alt. 129.60$       

No. 30 No Bid 328.00$       269.80$       No Bid 307.20$     
Alt. 250.00$       358.00$       

ITEMS 10A & B The apparent low bidder did not bid on spreading the fertilizer.  This will be done on a separate contract. 
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