BID SUMMARY

RFP # 6260

2/6/2006

|.T.S ROBERT G. DEVAULT
Voice Data Systems Suntel Services CDW Government Inc OM Office Supply, Inc Iﬁgiltr:etl
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Model No. Qty Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
DS1404038 2 8,500.00 17,000.00 10,196.60 20,393.20 8,279.99 16,559.98 8,950.00 17,900.00 [ NO BID
AA1419003 2 1,660.00 3,320.00 2,036.60 4,073.20 1,776.99 3,5653.98 1,745.00 3,490.00 | NOBID
DS1402002 1 3,400.00 3,400.00 4,076.60 4,076.60 3,398.99 3,398.99 3,670.00 3,670.00 | NOBID
DS1404090 1 8,510.00 8,510.00 10,196.60 10,196.60 8,279.99 8,279.99 8,948.00 8,948.00 | NO BID
DS1410003-3.7 | 1 3,140.00 3,140.00 3,396.60 3,396.60 2,866.99 2,866.99 3,200.00 3,200.00 | NOBID
DS1405A08 2 1,130.00 2,260.00 1,356.60 2,713.20 1,108.99 2,217.98 1,300.00 2,600.00 | NO BID
AA1419001 2 195.00 390.00 216.00 432.00 206.99 413.98 210.00 420.00 [ NOBID
AL2012E34 7 2,490.00 17,430.00 3,056.60 21,396.20 2,438.99 17,072.93 2,638.00 18,466.00 | NO BID
AA1419013 2 190.00 380.00 211.00 422.00 187.99 375.98 204.00 408.00 | NOBID
AA0020050 2 N/C N/C N/C N/C 0.01 0.02 2.00 4.00 | NOBID
Shipping 1 Included Included Included Included
Mandatory NOT SUPPLIED SUPPLIED NOT
Addenda B SUPPLIED SUPPLIED
TOTAL 55,830.00 67,099.60 54,740.82 59,106.00 | NO BID
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