BID SUMMARY RFP # 6254 1/26/2006
NorthEast Ameriseal Child Safe Spectra Spectra| Michigan Profess
Aquatic Design and Products Contract Turf Recreation Pool
and Supply Restoration Inc Flooring Constr Techs
LLC Inc LLC

Independence Lake

Spray Pads

Mobilization $ 20,901.00 | $ 4,240.00 | $ 1,525.00 | $ 509.00

Demolition $ 34,490.00 | $ 16,960.00 | $ 3,450.50 | $ 1,250.00

Prep concrete surfaces $ 8,622.50 | $ 4,860.00 No charge $ 1,000.00

Install proposed $ 76,912.70 | $ 14,840.00 |$ 22,93585|$ 13,796.00

surfacing system

Total $ 140,927.00 | $ 40,900.00 ($ 27,911.35|$% 16,555.00 | no bid no bid no bhid

Awarded/Negotiated $ 33,900.00

Rolling Hills Wet

Playground

Mobilization $ 16,334.00 | $ 7,660.00 | $ 1,525.00 | $ 500.00

Demolition $ 32,973.00 | $ 26,640.00 | $ 3,631.50 | $ 1,890.00

Misc Related items $ 9,075.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 1,000.00

Prep concrete surfaces $ 9,075.00 | $ 8,990.00 No charge $ 2,000.00

Install proposed $ 80,949.00 | $ 26,810.00 | $ 38,115.00|$ 25,410.00

surfacing system

Total $ 148,406.00 | $ 74,100.00 | $ 49,771.50|$ 30,800.00 | no bid no bid no bid

Awarded/Negotiated $ 74,100.00

Rolling Hills

Spray Pad

Mobilization $ 5,659.00 | $ 1,782.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 650.97

Demolition $ 10,689.00 | $ 7,128.00 | $ 1,527.00 | $ 1,500.00

Prep concrete surfaces $ 2,545.00 | $ 2,673.00 No Charge $ 2,000.00

Install proposed $ 220140 $ 5,737.00 | $ 9,162.00 | $ 8,000.00

surfacing system

Total $ 41,595.00 | $ 17,320.00 [$ 11,739.00 [ $ 12,150.92 | no hid no bid no bid

Awarded/Negotiated $ 17,320.00

TOTAL BOTH $ 330,928.00 | $ 132,320.00 | $ 89,421.85|$% 59,505.92

PARKS

Awarded/Negotiated

Annual Inspections $ 2500.00/visit | $ 5,180.00 | $ 3,500.00

Awarded/Negotiated No Charge

Alternate Bid $ 39,443.00 | $ 12,680.00 | $ 6,750.00 | $ 4,786.88

GRAND TOTAL $ 370,371.00 | $ 145,000.00 | $ 96,171.85|$ 64,292.28

Awarded/Negotiated $ 138,000.00
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