BID SUMMARY

Finance

RFP # 6072 6/11/2003

ROBERT G. DEVAULT
BKR Wolinski Rehman Price

Total All-Inclusive Dupuis & & Company Robson Waterhouse

Maximum Fee Ryden Coopers
2003 $ 86,000.00 | $ 96,645.00 | $ 108,000.00 NO BID
2004 $ 88,000.00 | $ 97,495.00 | % 109,500.00 NO BID
2005 $ 90,000.00 | $ 100,980.00 | $ 111,000.00 NO BID
2006 $ 92,000.00 | $ 102,085.00 | $§ 112,500.00 NO BID
2007 $ 94,000.00 | $ 107,355.00 | $§ 114,000.00 NO BID
2008 $ 96,000.00 | $ 109,905.00 | $ 115,500.00 NO BID
2009 $ 98,000.00 [ $§ 116,025.00 | $§ 117,000.00 NO BID




