
NOTE: 
MP = Mixed paper
MC = Mixed containers

Location Address Containers Pick-Ups  Price/month Price/month  Price/month  Price per 
Svc event 

 Svc 
Events/Year 

 Annual Cost 

(# and size)  (Year 1)  (Year 2)  (Year 3) 
Administration 
Building

220 N. Main St., Ann 
Arbor

 5-MP, 1-MC Weekly             181.55           181.55                181.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

 1- 4cy Dumpster Weekly               80.00             80.00                  80.00          10.00 52             520.00 

Service Center 4133 Washtenaw, 
Ann Arbor 

 2-MP, 1-MC Weekly             166.55           166.55                166.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

 1- 4cy Dumpster Biweekly               80.00             80.00                  80.00          10.00 26             260.00 
Juvenile Court 2270 Platt Road, 

Ann Arbor
 2-MP, 1-MC Weekly             166.55           166.55                166.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

 1- 4cy Dumpster Biweekly               80.00             80.00                  80.00          10.00 26             260.00 
Facilities Mgt. 
Center

2155 Hogback  Rd., 
Ann Arbor

 1-MP, 1-MC Weekly             161.55           161.55                161.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

 1- 4cy Dumpster Weekly               80.00             80.00                  80.00          10.00 52             520.00 
Community 
Corrections

3810 Packard Rd.                          -              -    no bid no bid no bid  no bid no bid no bid

NOW VACANT
County Jail 2201 Hogback Rd., 

Ann Arbor
 1-30yd rolloff 2x/week          2,424.80        2,424.80             2,424.80        100.00 104        10,400.00 

County Jail 
(Sheriff's offices)

2201 Hogback Rd., 
Ann Arbor

 4-MP, 1-MC Weekly             176.55           176.55                176.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

Department of 
Social Services 
(A2)

2140 E. Ellsworth, 
Ann Arbor

 2-MP, 1-MC Weekly             166.55           166.55                166.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

 1- 4cy Dumpster Biweekly               80.00             80.00                  80.00          10.00 26             260.00 

RecycleMax, Inc.
10455 Ford Road

Dearborn, MI 48126
313-581-9190  734-662-6288 

Recycle Ann Arbor 
 2420 S. Industrial Hwy. 

 Ann Arbor, MI 48104 



Youth Center - 
Juvenile 
Detention

4125 Washtenaw  2-MP, 1-MC Weekly             166.55           166.55                166.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

 1- 4cy Dumpster Weekly               80.00             80.00                  80.00          10.00 52             520.00 
Department of 
Social Services 
(Ypsi)

22 Center Street, 
Ypsilanti

 5-MP, 1-MC Weekly             181.55           181.55                181.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

 1- 4cy Dumpster Weekly               80.00             80.00                  80.00          10.00 52             520.00 
Western Service 
Center

705 N. Zeeb Rd., 
Ann Arbor

 3-MP, 1-MC Weekly             171.55           171.55                171.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

 1- 4cy Dumpster Biweekly               80.00             80.00                  80.00          10.00 26             260.00 
Head Start 
Administration

3075 Washtenaw, 
Ann Arbor

 1-MP, 1-MC Biweekly               85.60             85.60                  85.60          21.25 26             552.50 

Public Health 10 S. Prospect, 
Ypsilanti

 1-MP, 1-MC Biweekly               85.60             85.60                  85.60          21.25 26             552.50 

Eastern Co. Gvt. 
Center

415 W. Michigan, 
Ypsilanti

 1-MP, 1-MC Weekly             161.55           161.55                161.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

Perry Learning 
Center

633 Harriet, Ypsilanti  2-MP, 1-MC Weekly             166.55           166.55                166.55          21.25 52          1,105.00 

Total per year 61,236.60     61,236.60  61,236.60         26,780.00     


