
BID SUMMARY
INFORMATION
TECHNOLOGY SERVICES

RFP # 6041  1/23/2003
ROBERT G. DEVAULT

Automated Avaya Cross Complete
Telecom, Inc Telecom Communications

Section 4.1
1 Regular $4,200.00 $10,812.96 $12,314.76 No Bid
1 Extended $4,600.00 $13,105.20 $14,777.64 No Bid
2 Regular $9,400.00 $10,446.36 $11,588.40 No Bid
2 Extended $9,800.00 $12,535.56 $13,906.08 No Bid

Section 4.2
Minimum labor $100.00 $170.00 $140.00 No Bid
Additional labor
Minimum overtime $150.00 $300.00 $210.00 No Bid
Additional overtime
Service/Travel charge $60.00 No Bid
Urgent request charge $200.00 $150.00 No Bid

Section 4.3
Relocation $350.00 $750.00 $630.00 No Bid
FLTN card (each) $5,200.00 $4,875.00 $5,330.00 No Bid
Programming $800.00 $1,020.00 $3,360.00 No Bid
Installation $150.00 $1,500.00 $1,260.00 No Bid

Total $11,700.00 $13,020.00 $15,910.00 No Bid
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