
BID SUMMARY
Inform Tech

RFP # 6031  2/13/2003

ROBERT G. DEVAULT

Telcom Great Lakes MBM Computer CommTech
Service Telecom System Services

Corp Inc Solutions Inc

Minimum Labor Amount 50.00$                 123.75$               56.80$               No Bid

Labor Cost for .5 Hours 50.00$                 123.75$               37.50$               No Bid

Labor Cost for 1 Hour 50.00$                 123.75$               75.00$               No Bid

Labor Cost for 1.5 Hours 75.00$                 165.00$               112.50$             No Bid

Labor Cost for 2 Hours 100.00$               205.75$               150.00$             No Bid

Travel Cost Included Yes Yes No No Bid

Percentage Mark up 25% 35% 20% No Bid
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