BID SUMMARY RFP # 6414 8/14/2008
Parks and Recreation
ROBERT G. DEVAULT
White Baseline Brock &
Construction Constructors Associates
Inc DBA/
Legendary
Timberworks

Mobilization NO-BID $ 3,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
Repair to Building #11 NO-BID $ 28,000.00 | $ 23,000.00
Repair to Building #9 NO-BID $ 14,000.00 | $ 7,000.00
Repair to Building #6 NO-BID $ 12,000.00 | $ 7,500.00
Repair to Building #8 NO-BID $ 1,250.00 | $ 1,800.00
Repair to Building #7 NO-BID $ 9,000.00 | $ 4,500.00
Repair to Building #5 NO-BID $ 4,500.00 | $ 2,000.00
Repair to Building #12 NO-BID $ 3,000.00 | $ 1,100.00
Repair to Building #13 NO-BID $ 3,000.00 | $ 800.00
Remove Building #10 NO-BID $ 1,000.00 | $ 700.00
Laborer NO-BID $61.53/HR $55.00/HR
General Work NO-BID $ 1,500.00
Base Bid Lump Sum NO-BID $ 78,750.00 | $ 49,700.00 | s/b $51,900.00
Add Alternate Painting NO-BID NO-BID $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
Total Bid Price NO-BID $ 67,700.00 | s/b $$69,900.00

AWARDED TO BROCK




