BID SUMMARY
Support Services

RFP # 6395

Phoenix J.L. Judge Irish E.L. Bailey & Co Davenport Brothers
The Garrison Co Contractors Construction Svc.| Construction Co Inc A.R. Brouwer Co| Construction Inc Spence Brothers Bernco Inc.
Base Bid $ 2,005,000.00 | $ 1,709,000.00 | $ 1,844,000.00 | $ 1,930,000.00 | $ 1,978,000.00 | $ 2,083,000.00 | $ 1,967,000.00 | $ 1,777,000.00 | $ 1,835,000.00
Alternate 1 $ (200.00)| $ (1,250.00) n/c $ (1,500.00)| $ (738.00)| $ (2,318.00)| $ 1,500.00 | $ (1,300.00)| $ (2,375.00)
Alternate 2 $ 10,900.00 | $ (2,600.00)| $ 5,000.00 | $ (1,900.00)| $ 3,277.00 | $ 4,217.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ (3,350.00)
Alternate 3 $ (51,400.00)] $ 21,000.00 [ $ (10,000.00)[ $ 3,700.00 | $ (22,265.00)| $ (32,705.00)| $ (18,000.00)| $ (39,500.00)] $ (46,380.00)
Alternate 4 $ (13,300.00)[ $ (3,500.00)( $ (3,000.00)| $ (6,700.00)| $ (9,280.00)| $ (4,280.00)| $ (4,500.00)| $ (9,000.00)| $ (3,100.00)
Alternate 5 $ (22,000.00)| $ (6,800.00)| $ (2,000.00)| $ (2,800.00)| $ 8,698.00 | $ (8,124.00)| $ (2,315.00)| $ (9,000.00)| $ (2,775.00)
Alternate 6 $ (600.00)| $ (600.00)| $ (400.00)| $ (400.00)| $ (864.00)| $ (400.00)| $ (600.00)| $ (2,200.00)| $ (2,600.00)
Alternate 7 $ (5,400.00)| $ (6,500.00)| $ (7,000.00)| $ (5,000.00)| $ (7,950.00)| $ (7,513.00)| $ (3,800.00)| $ (13,500.00)[ $ (6,500.00)
Alternate 8 $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,189.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 600.00 | *needs clarified | $ (6,500.00)
Alternate 9 $ 26,000.00 | $ 21,000.00] $ 20,000.00 | $ 14,500.00 | $ 22,178.00 | $ 23,813.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 13,500.00 | $  13,600.00
Alternate 10 $ 9,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 7,618.00 | $ 8,102.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 7,800.00 [ $ 8,200.00
Alternate 11 $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 3,242.00 | $ 8,415.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 600.00
Alternate 12 $ 6,800.00 | $ 5,000.00 no bid $ 6,400.00 | $ 5,673.00 | $ 8,415.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 4,860.00
Unit Pricing 1 $ 9.00 [ $ 10.00 no bid $ 11.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1400 | $ 9.00| % 10.00 | $ 10.00
Unit Pricing 2 $ 1850 | $ 15.00 no bid $ 1980 | $ 25.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 24.00
Unit Pricing 3 - raising $ 149.00 | $ 7.00 no bid $ 282.10 | $ 181.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 110.00
Unit Pricing 3 - lowering | $ 149.00 | $ 7.00 no bid $ 282.10 | $ 217.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 138.00
Unit Price 4-sand $ 1450 | $ 15.00 no bid $ 1485 | $ 12.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 12.00
Unit Price 4-fill $ 1050 | $ 12.00 no bid $ 1210 | $ 10.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 10.00
Unit Price4-sand/gravel | $ 16.25 | $ 17.00 no bid $ 2750 | $ 14.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 14.00
Unit Price 4-aggregate $ 1875 | $ 32.00 no bid $ 24.75 | $ 29.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 29.00
Unit Price4-cr. Concrete | $ 1875 | $ 27.00 no bid $ 2090 | $ 25.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 33.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 24.00
Substitutions NA see proposal see proposal NA NA see proposal na na NA
oYK Krull Verhines Custom
Engineering & Construction Co. Bldr/Orion I Clark's Construction| Sorensen Gross

Quadrants, linc Construction A.Z. Shmina, Inc. Inc Bedzyk Bros. Inc | Construction Inc Co. Construction Svc
Base Bid $ 1,845,000.00 | $1,748,695.00 [ $ 1,927,000.00 | $ 1,918,000.00 [ $ 1,888,000.00 | $ 1,940,000.00 | $ 2,043,491.00 [ $ 1,679,000.00
Alternate 1 $ (362.00)| $ (2,575.00)| $ 8,500.00 | $ (500.00)| $ (1,100.00)| $ (500.00)| $ (1,450.00)| $ 300.00
Alternate 2 $ 7,981.00 [ $ (5,000.00)| $ 7,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 300.00 | $ (2,500.00)| $ (4,550.00)| $ 5,000.00
Alternate 3 $ (50,085.00)| nc $ (30,000.00)| no bid $ (23,500.00)| $ 6,300.00 | $ (19,350.00)| $ (8,300.00)
Alternate 4 $ (8,066.00)| $ (2,800.00)| $ (4,000.00)| $ (9,000.00)| $ (3,000.00)| $ (1,800.00)| $ (2,200.00)| $ (8,200.00)
Alternate 5 $ (3,000.00)| $ (3,000.00)| $ (1,500.00) $ (16,000.00)| $ (2,800.00)| $ (1,800.00)| $ (3,100.00)| $ (3,600.00)
Alternate 6 $ (400.00)| $ (700.00)| $ (600.00)| $ (500.00)| $ (2,500.00)| no bid $ (440.00)| $ (2,600.00)
Alternate 7 $ (6,200.00)| $ (4,104.00)| $ (8,000.00)| $ (6,000.00)| $ (5,000.00)| $ (3,000.00)| $ (4,950.00)| $ (14,200.00)
Alternate 8 $ 1,265.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 8,000.00 [ $ 1,200.00 | $ 600.00 | $ (1,500.00)| $ 1,720.00 | $ 1,150.00
Alternate 9 $ 17,242.00 | $ 22,898.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 25,500.00 | $ 22,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 23,448.00 | $ 11,350.00
Alternate 10 $ 8,624.00 [ $ 7,896.00 [ $ 9,000.00 | $ 7,600.00 [ $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,500.00 | *needs clarified $ 6,900.00
Alternate 11 $ 300.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 2,560.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 410.00
Alternate 12 $ 7,200.00 [ $ 6,600.00 | $ 6,000.00 [ $ 10,500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 20,460.00 | $ 13,700.00 | $ 14,300.00
Unit Pricing 1 $ 12.00 | $ 1080 | $ 1500 | $ 1050 | $ 1350 | $ 70.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 7.70
Unit Pricing 2 $ 30.00 | $ 26.40 | $ 26.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 11.00
Unit Pricing 3 - raising $ 230.00 | $ 1350 | $ 140.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 125.00 | none $ 180.00 | nc
Unit Pricing 3 - lowering | $ 230.00 | $ 13.50 | $ 200.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 162.00 | nc
Unit Price 4-sand $ 17.00 | $ 1350 | $ 1500 | $ 13.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 950 | $ 1850 | $ 16.50
Unit Price 4-fill $ 12.00 | $ 1080 | $ 1400 | $ 10.00 | $ 1575 | $ 1350 | $ 1400 | $ 15.40
Unit Price4-sand/gravel | $ 17.00 | $ 1560 | $ 18.00 | $ 1500 | $ 2750 | $ 2550 | $ 2150 | $ 16.50
Unit Price 4-aggregate $ 35.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 36.50 | $ 13.50 | $ 28.50 | $ 33.00
Unit Price4-cr. Concrete | $ 26.00 | $ 2472 |1 $ 27.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 1550 | $ 30.50 | $ 23.10
Substitutions na na na na na na see proposal na

Awarded to Sorensen Gross

6/06/2008
Robert G. Devault



