RFP # 6363 Spreadsheet

11. Sex
Offender
1. Social 2. County 3. State 6. Motor 8. Professional | 9. Professional |10. Developed Registry
Security Criminal Criminal 4. Education Vehicle 7. Credit License Organization Reference & Query
Vendor Name Trace History History Verification 5. Employment Record History Verification Affiliation Interviews (National) Package A Package B Package C
$20.00 per
$5.00 per name -
name/count $15.00
y| State of Ml
searched*M access
any| fee*Many
jurisdictions|jurisdictions
charge charge
"access "access
fees" to fees" to
obtain this| obtain this
information. |information. $12.00
These fees| These fees including
change change $7.00 State
frequently| frequently of Michigan $15.00
and cannot| and cannot| fee all other does
be built into| be built into states| require one
price. They| price. They $20.00 for up| $5.00 fee| time onsite
are a pass-| are a pass- to 3| plus access visit by
$6.00 per through through| $20.00 for up| employment|fee charged credit $15.00 per $15.00 per| $60.00/per| $15.00 per
A.S.K. Services, Inc. name cost. cost.| to 3 schools| verifications by state bureau name name| hour spent name $83.00 $188.00 $25.00
$30.75 7 yr
unlimited $4.95
county above state
criminal*Ex fee per
cludes state
county MVR**Excl
court ude state
criminal $14.95 per MVR
access fees| Michigan employee access
see[ $15.95 all $39.95| fees. See Free with
$3.15 per| Addendum]other states| $14.95 per unlimited| Addendum $12.95 other
AccuSource, Inc. name F $11.95 institution employers G $8.95 $9.95 each|  $9.95 each each services $99.95 $125.95 $32.95
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11. Sex
Offender
1. Social 2. County 3. State 6. Motor 8. Professional | 9. Professional |10. Developed Registry
Security Criminal Criminal 4. Education Vehicle 7. Credit License Organization Reference & Query
Vendor Name Trace History History Verification 5. Employment Record History Verification Affiliation Interviews (National) Package A Package B Package C
$4.00 plus
State fees
$8.00 per (Michigan
county or state fee is
Combine 1 $7.25)
and 2 for National
the Acxiom Driving
$3.00] TRUSST record
Additional| package - (NDR) -
address receive $14.00 Option 1 Option 1 Option 1
search| unlimited $7.00+ Through $52.00; &1.50; $18.00;
method county| state fee the state of Option 2 Option 2 Option 2
through criminal| (Michigan FL is 66.00; $66.00; $32.00;
proprietary| searches| state fee recommend Option 3 Option 3 Option 3
database| off of the|ids $10.00), ed to $71.00; $71.00; $37.00;
Acxiom Information Security "FMP" -] SSN Trace| so $17.00 collect a Option 4 Option 4 Option
Services $4.00( for $25.00| per search $11.00 $9.00( full history $4.50 $7.00 $8.00 $50.00 $5.00 $75.00 $75.00 $41.00
$72.00
(includes
ALL
counties of $45.00
resident, 2 (includes
employmen ALL
$1.50 + t $84.50*| counties of
State Fee verification Does not| residence
(Michigan s, 1 include and 1
$12.50/cou State fee = education|pricing for 9| statewide
ADP $2.00 nty $21.50 7.50 $7.50 $7.25) $6.00 $7.50 No Bid No Bid $9.00| verification) & 10 search
$54.00 $90.00 $27.00
Package| Package| Package
pricing pricing pricing
assumes| assumes| assumes
one county| one county| one county
and one and one and one
Axiom Investigative $13.00 per|[ $14.00 per state state state
Services, LLC $1.50 county state $8.00 $8.00 $11.00 $11.00 $8.00 $9.00 $9.00 $1.00 search search search
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11. Sex
Offender
1. Social 2. County 3. State 6. Motor 8. Professional | 9. Professional |10. Developed Registry
Security Criminal Criminal 4. Education Vehicle 7. Credit License Organization Reference & Query
Vendor Name Trace History History Verification 5. Employment Record History Verification Affiliation Interviews (National) Package A Package B Package C
$50.00 per| $50.00 per $40.00 per
record + record + $60.00 per record +
Background Investigations $20.00 per| governmen| governmen school per|]  $60.00 per| governmen| $25.00 per $25.00 per $55.00 Oper
Group, LLC candidate| t surcharge| t surcharge candidate employer| t surcharge report license No Charge hour] No Charge $280.00 $330.00 $100.00
consumer Intelligence $6.00 plus
Agency, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| state fee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.65 $85.20 $99.00 $40.00
$75.00*Stat| $115.00*St
ewide atewide| *Statewide
criminal criminal criminal
searches| searches| searches
are billed| are billed] are billed
outside outside outside
package package package
prices due| prices due| prices due
to varied to varied to varied
price and| price and| price and
availability. | availability. [ availability.
Please Please Please
refer to refer to refer to
$10.00 per addendum| addendum| addendum
employer or E for E for E for
$28.00 for price/availa| price/availa| price/availa
Varies, see unlimited 7 bility of bility of bility of
state list in year statewide| statewide| statewide
Addendum employment| $3.00 plus criminal criminal criminal
employeescreen 1Q $3.00 $10.00 E $10.00 history| state fee $5.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $5.00| searches.| searches.| searches.
Fifer Investigations, LLC $10.00 $30.00 $20.00 $15.00 $25.00 $20.00 $30.00 $10.00 $10.00 $35.00 $5.00 $105.00 $185.00 $45.00
$220.00
($50.00/hr
Ghent Ellerbrake LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.00 + costs) $50.00
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11. Sex
Offender
1. Social 2. County 3. State 6. Motor 8. Professional | 9. Professional |10. Developed Registry
Security Criminal Criminal 4. Education Vehicle 7. Credit License Organization Reference & Query
Vendor Name Trace History History Verification 5. Employment Record History Verification Affiliation Interviews (National) Package A Package B Package C
$6.50 each
+ (county
mandated| $3.00 each $2.50 each
court fee) + (state + (state
e.g.| mandated| $5.00 each + mandated See Bid See Bid
Washtenaw| fee) e.g. Ml (3.00 party fee, e.g. Ml Sheet Sheet
$0.00 =| $10.00 =| vendor cost if is $7.00) = $25.25+| $46.50 + See Bid
Gobackgrounds.com $1.50 each $6.00 $13.00| applicable)] $7.25 each $9.50| $7.75 each $3.50 each|  $3.50 each| $6.50 each| $5.00 each fees fees Sheet
Free
Source 1 inclusive in
$7.50; $12.00 all
Source 2| Source 1 MISOS comprehen
I.S.I.S., Inc. (International $15.00; $17.50; $27.50 $22.50[ $35.00 (all sive
Strategic Intelligence Source 3| Source 2 ICHAT physical (national 33| reporting $35.00/hr| inspection
Services, Inc.) $10.00 $12.50 $12.50| verification $13.00 states) bureau) $27.00 $17.50| interviews reports $65.00 $125.00 $25.00
Icon Investigations &
Security, Inc. $6.00 $33.00 $33.00 $12.00 $8.00 $8.00 $11.00 $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 $100.00 $129.00 $66.00
Info Check USA $4.95 $19.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $16.95 $10.50 $14.95 $9.95 $14.95 7,95 $79.95 $99.95 $29.95
$9.45 per
state
$2.00 per| $9.45 per| (excluding $7.95 per $8.50 per| $10.00 per| $6.95 per $7.95 per $7.95 per| $10.95 per| $3.25 per
Infomart applicant| jurisdiction| New York) institution employer| applicant| applicant applicant applicant| applicant| applicant $65.96 $96.95 $24.95
$41.00**Inc| $80.00**Inc| $20.00**Inc
ludes one| ludes one| ludes one
$10.25*Pluf $9.25*Plus $3.75*Plus $8.25*Plus of each of each of each
s any any $8.25*Plus any any service service service
additional| additional any| additional $8.25*Plus $8.25*Plus| additional type listed.| type listed.| type listed.
fees fees necessary fees any additional| any additional fees Plus any Plus any Plus any
needed to| needed to fees needed| needed to fees needed| fees needed| needed to mandatory| mandatory| mandatory
access the| access the to access the| access the to access the| to access the| access the fees fees fees
information| information information| information information information| information necessary| necessary| necessary
with no with no with no with no with no with no with no to access| toaccess| to access
additional| additional additional| additional additional additional| additional the the the
Inquiries, Inc $2.75 markup markup $15.00 markup markup $7.75 markup markup markup $6.75|information. [information. [information.
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11. Sex
Offender
1. Social 2. County 3. State 6. Motor 8. Professional | 9. Professional |10. Developed Registry
Security Criminal Criminal 4. Education Vehicle 7. Credit License Organization Reference & Query
Vendor Name Trace History History Verification 5. Employment Record History Verification Affiliation Interviews (National) Package A Package B Package C
$8.00 per $10.00
State (not (FICO
all States $6.00 +| score will
available $6.00w/o| State Fees not be
due to no "900" fees, (current| supplied on
$8.00 per central $6.00 per|$8.00 w/"900"|  Michigan report in
Integrates Screening $1..50 per| County, per| administrati level fees| State Fee|accordance $37.50 +| $68.50 +| $18.00 +
Partners search Name on) (domestic)] (domestic)[ is $7.00)[ with FCRA) $7.00 $7.00 $7.00 $3.00 State Fee| State Fee| State Fee
$18.00 any
names or
courts
beyond the
county of
residence
will be
charged an
additional
$180.00 for
each name
Intelli:Quest, LLC $8.00] and court $15.00 $12.00 $8.00 $12.00 $10.00 $12.00 $10.00 $15.00 $5.00 $72.80 $84.90 $30.00
$915.00] $1230.00
$25.00 plus plus|$315.00 per
Credit $170.00 per|$170.00 per| county/stat
$175.00 per|$175.00 per Report per additional| additional] e criminal
James Mintz Group $150.00|search area| search areal $200.00 $240.00 $75.00 bureau $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $25.00| search area|search area history
$123.25
does not
include
Professiona
I
Organizatio
n Affiliation See Bid
Kelmar & Associates $1.75 $15.00 $12.50 $15.00 $15.00 $12.50 $15.00 $20.00 No Bid $15.00 $1.50 $71.75 fee Sheet
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11. Sex
Offender
1. Social 2. County 3. State 6. Motor 8. Professional | 9. Professional |10. Developed Registry
Security Criminal Criminal 4. Education Vehicle 7. Credit License Organization Reference & Query
Vendor Name Trace History History Verification 5. Employment Record History Verification Affiliation Interviews (National) Package A Package B Package C
$20.00 (per
$20.00 (per state if| $15.00 (per $20.00 (5 $8.00 per
Nationwide Background $5.00 a laf county) a laf available) a| institution) a| year history)| $15.00 ala| $20.00 ala| $15.00alal $15.00 a la| reference a] $5.00 a la
Solutions carte carte la carte la carte a la carte carte carte carte carte la carte carte $70.00 $105.00 $20.00
$65.00
includes 4
jobs
references / $45.00
additional {additional
jobs states add:
$85.00 per references| $65.00 per| $10.00 per
NB Home Security Inc. $25.00 county $65.00] add: $15.00 applicant state} No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$7.50 each| $7.50 each
*searches will| *searches will
be conducted| be conducted
as per scope| as per scope
on on
Amendment| Amendment
#1 (dated #1 (dated No fee for
Pinkerton Consulting and $7.00 plus| #8.50 plus Oct. 16, Oct. 16,] $5.50 plus $34.00 plus| $65.00 plus Support
Investigations $1.75 fees| state fees 2007) 2007)| state fees $5.50 $7.50[ $7.50 each| $7.50 each $3.00 fees fees| Services
$25.00 with
signed
Prestige Investigations $25.00 $125.00 $125.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 release $50.00 $50.00 $75.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
$40.00 per
county;
$65.00/hour
plus
mileage for
in-person
Reed Detective Agency Inc $40.00| searches $20.00| $65.00/hour| $65.00/hour $15.00 N/A $15.00 $15.00|$65.00/hour $15.00 $300.00 $400.00 N/A
Screeningone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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11. Sex
Offender
1. Social 2. County 3. State 6. Motor 8. Professional | 9. Professional |10. Developed Registry
Security Criminal Criminal 4. Education Vehicle 7. Credit License Organization Reference & Query
Vendor Name Trace History History Verification 5. Employment Record History Verification Affiliation Interviews (National) Package A Package B Package C
Second Nature Research See Bid
Group $15.00 $25.00 $35.00 $85.00 $85.00 $35.00 $65.00 $15.00 $35.00 $48.00 $20.00 $200.00 $300.00 Sheet
$86.00 $146.50 $37.50
*See assuming| assuming| assuming
attached the MVR &| the MVR &| the State
list: Motor the State Il| the State Il Criminal
Teachout Security Services State's Vehicle check were| check were| History was
Inc $7.50 $18.50 Cost $12.50 $12.50| State Fees $12.00 $18.00 $18.00 $12.50 $15.00 Ml Ml for Ml
$30.00 $60.00
$150.00| (database| (telephone or $90.00 $60.00
(via mail or search, mail| (telephone $30.00 $20.00 (telephone
internet, not| Michigan| certification| verification| (Michigan (Michigan interview
Urban & Associates, Inc. $25.00( "in person") only) only) only)] SOS only) No Bid only) No Bid only) $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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11. Sex
Offender
1. Social 2. County 3. State 6. Motor 8. Professional | 9. Professional |10. Developed Registry
Security Criminal Criminal 4. Education Vehicle 7. Credit License Organization Reference & Query
Vendor Name Trace History History Verification 5. Employment Record History Verification Affiliation Interviews (National) Package A Package B Package C
$10.50 per
county or
$28.00 for
all county| $10.00 per
of| state where
residence*| available*A
About 5%| bout 5% of
of counties counties
nationwide| nationwide
and most| and most
states states $3.00*Most
charge a| charge a states
fee for fee for charge a $47.00 $83.00 $20.50
access to| access to fee for single single single
their their access to county, county, county,
criminal criminal their Motor $62.50 all] $89.00 allf $38.00 all
records. records. Vehicle counties counties counties
When When Department criminal criminal criminal
applicable| applicable records. check*Pack| check*Pack| check*Pack
these fees| these fees This fee will age price is| age price is| age price is
$4.50 will be in will be in be in exclusive| exclusive| exclusive
includes| addition to| addition to $12.00 per] $12.00 per| addition to of any of any of any
compliment| the USA-| the USA- school employer| the USA- applicable| applicable| applicable
ary SSN FACT FACT]| including 900| including 900 FACT governmen| governmen| governmen
USA-FACT Inc validation| service fee.|service fee.| number fees| number fees| service fee. $5.00 $7.50 $7.50 $10.00 $7.00 t fees. t fees. t fees.
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