BID SUMMARY RFP # 6292 9/11/2006
Fac Mgmt
ROBERT G. DEVAULT
Cole and GMB Jeffery A Scott David Milling Carter &
Russell Architects Architects & Associates Burgess
Architects Engineers P.C. Architects Consultants
Inc
NO BID
Hourly Rate NO BID $45.00 to $125.00 $45.00 to $130.00 $50.00 to $135.00
NO BID
Bid Example [ $ 4,000.00 NO BID $ 5700.00 | $ 6,910.00 16,380.00
NSA DLZ Dynamic CHMP Doshi
Architects Michigan Consultants Inc Associates
Engineers Inc Inc Inc
Planners
Hourly Rate $ 70.00 $36.00 to $144.00 $45.00 to $98.00 $27.75 to $125.00 $38.00 to $165.00
Bid Example [ $ 4,000.00 | $5,400.00 to $9,000.00 NO BID $ 5,750.00 23,040.00
THA Menechini & A3C Mitchell and Partners in
Architects Associates Collaborative Mouat Architecture
Engineers LLC Architecture Architects PLC
Hourly Rate $40.00 to $118.00 $45.00 to $115.00 $55.00 to $100.00 $45.00 to $125.00 $40.00 to $95.00
Bid Example [ $ 2,240.00 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 1,310.00 | $ 4,500.00 6,000.00




BID SUMMARY RFP # 6292 9/11/2006
Fac Mgmt
ROBERT G. DEVAULT
Sigma JFR Dan Joseph ABE CDPA
Associates Architects Architects Associates Architects
Inc PC LLC Inc Inc
Hourly Rate $59.00 to $153.00 $67.99 to $121.99 $65.00 to $125.00 $55.00 to $175.00 $30.00 to $125.00
Bid Example | $ 57,200.00 27,500.00 | $ 520.00 | $ 23,040.00 | $ 19,900.00
Spicer Hooker/Dejong James Childs Integrated Straub
Group Architects & Architects Design Pettitt
Inc Engineers Solutions, LLC Yaste
Hourly Rate $53.00 to $150.00 $70.00 to $95.00 $40.00 to $140.00 $50.00 to $140.00 $60.00 to $140.00
Bid Example [ $5,000.00 to $10,000.00 6,650.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 10,900.00 | $4,000.00 to $8,000.00
Hobbs & Black
Associates
Inc
Hourly Rate $45.00 to $170.00
Bid Example [ $ 12,780.00
Awarded to Dan Joseph Architects A3C Collaborative THA Architects
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